
Bid Item 

Number Product Description

Unit of 

Measure

Estimated 

Quantity Price Extended Cost Price Extended Cost Price Extended Cost Price Extended Cost

1 Influent BOD-5 Each 10 30.00$                 300.00$                                   30.00$                 300.00$                                   No Bid -$                                         50.00$                 500.00$                                   

2 Influent TSS Each 10 5.00$                   50.00$                                     15.00$                 150.00$                                   No Bid -$                                         22.00$                 220.00$                                   

3 Influent Oil/Grease Each 150 60.00$                 9,000.00$                                40.00$                 6,000.00$                                No Bid -$                                         90.00$                 13,500.00$                              `

4 Effluent Ammonia Each 70 25.00$                 1,750.00$                                20.00$                 1,400.00$                                No Bid -$                                         25.00$                 1,750.00$                                

5 Effluent BOD-5 Each 25 20.00$                 500.00$                                   30.00$                 750.00$                                   No Bid -$                                         50.00$                 1,250.00$                                

6 Effluent TSS Each 10 5.00$                   50.00$                                     15.00$                 150.00$                                   No Bid -$                                         22.00$                 220.00$                                   

7

Effluent Bio Monitoring Ceriodaphnia dubia 

and Pimephales promelas
Each 24

600.00$               14,400.00$                              No Bid -$                                         

 Cerio - $1950.00

Pime - $1950.00 

 Cerio - $46,800.00

Pime - $46,000.00 No Bid -$                                         

8

Effluent Acute Toxicity 7 Day Chronic 

Toxicity
Each 24

 Included in Line #7 -$                                         No Bid -$                                         Cost Listed Above 2,200.00$            52,800.00$                              

9 Effluent Arsenic Each 500 30.00$                 15,000.00$                              18.00$                 9,000.00$                                No Bid -$                                         33.00$                 16,500.00$                              

10 Effluent Turbidity Each 5 5.00$                   25.00$                                     14.00$                 70.00$                                     No Bid -$                                         20.00$                 100.00$                                   

11 Effluent TKN Each 40 25.00$                 1,000.00$                                30.00$                 1,200.00$                                No Bid -$                                         45.00$                 1,800.00$                                

12 Effluent Chlorides Each 40 15.00$                 600.00$                                   15.00$                 600.00$                                   No Bid -$                                         15.00$                 600.00$                                   

13 Effluent Nitrates Each 40 15.00$                 600.00$                                   15.00$                 600.00$                                   No Bid -$                                         30.00$                 1,200.00$                                

14 Effluent Total Dissolved Soilds Each 300 15.00$                 4,500.00$                                15.00$                 4,500.00$                                No Bid -$                                         20.00$                 6,000.00$                                

15 DMR/QA-QC Study Each 10 No Charge No Bid -$                                         No Bid -$                                         -$                     -$                                         

16 Belt Press % Solids Each 10 5.00$                   50.00$                                     10.00$                 100.00$                                   No Bid -$                                         15.00$                 150.00$                                   

17 Belt Press Full TCLP Each 10 700.00$               7,000.00$                                580.00$               5,800.00$                                No Bid -$                                         975.00$               9,750.00$                                

18 Belt Press Cake-Paint Filter Each 10 10.00$                 100.00$                                   15.00$                 150.00$                                   No Bid -$                                         20.00$                 200.00$                                   

19 Belt Press pH Each 10 10.00$                 100.00$                                   10.00$                 100.00$                                   No Bid -$                                         19.00$                 190.00$                                   

20

Effluent Metals by ICP-MS-Chromium, 

Nickel, Zinc, Arsenic, Cadmium, Copper, 

Lead, Silver

Each 25

80.00$                 2,000.00$                                64.00$                 1,600.00$                                No Bid -$                                         159.00$               3,975.00$                                

21 8082 PCBs by GC/ECD Each 15 20.00$                 300.00$                                   50.00$                 750.00$                                   No Bid -$                                         150.00$               2,250.00$                                

22 EPA 624 Volatiles Each 15 60.00$                 900.00$                                   55.00$                 825.00$                                   No Bid -$                                         150.00$               2,250.00$                                

23 EPA 625 Semi-volatiles Each 15 200.00$               3,000.00$                                150.00$               2,250.00$                                No Bid -$                                         250.00$               3,750.00$                                

24 EPA 608 Pesticides/PCBs Each 25 140.00$               3,500.00$                                110.00$               2,750.00$                                No Bid -$                                         300.00$               7,500.00$                                

25

EPA 200.7/200.8 Metals-Chromium, Nickel, 

Zinc, Arsenic, Cadmium, Copper, Lead, 

Silver

Each 15

110.00$               1,650.00$                                64.00$                 960.00$                                   No Bid -$                                         

 200.7 - $119.00

200.8 - $159.00 

 200.7 - $1785.00

200.8 - $2385.00 

26 EPA 245.1 Mercury Each 15 25.00$                 375.00$                                   25.00$                 375.00$                                   No Bid -$                                         40.00$                 600.00$                                   

27 EPA 335.2 Cyanide Each 15 35.00$                 525.00$                                   40.00$                 600.00$                                   No Bid -$                                         45.00$                 675.00$                                   

28 EPA 420.1 Phenolics Each 15 50.00$                 750.00$                                   35.00$                 525.00$                                   No Bid -$                                         40.00$                 600.00$                                   

29 TRPH (EPA 418.1) Each 15 30.00$                 450.00$                                   No Bid -$                                         No Bid -$                                         90.00$                 1,350.00$                                

30 EPA 1664 Oil and Grease Each 100 60.00$                 6,000.00$                                40.00$                 4,000.00$                                No Bid -$                                         90.00$                 9,000.00$                                

31

Outfall Metals (8 total) by ICP/MS Cr, Ni, Zn, 

As, CD, Cu, Pb, Ag
Each 15

80.00$                 1,200.00$                                64.00$                 960.00$                                   No Bid -$                                         159.00$               2,385.00$                                

32 Dioxins Each 15 140.00$               2,100.00$                                350.00$               5,250.00$                                No Bid -$                                         600.00$               9,000.00$                                

33 Total Organic Carbons Each 15 25.00$                 375.00$                                   32.00$                 480.00$                                   No Bid -$                                         60.00$                 900.00$                                   

34 EPA 524 Purgeable Organics Each 15 60.00$                 900.00$                                   55.00$                 825.00$                                   No Bid -$                                         125.00$               1,875.00$                                

35 EPA 136 Formaldehyde CWA Method Each 15 150.00$               2,250.00$                                No Bid -$                                         No Bid -$                                         No Bid -$                                         

36 EPA 136 Zirconium CWA Method Each 15 10.00$                 150.00$                                   No Bid -$                                         No Bid -$                                         No Bid -$                                         

37 SM 5310B TOC Each 30 25.00$                 750.00$                                   32.00$                 960.00$                                   No Bid -$                                         60.00$                 1,800.00$                                

38
EPA 200.7/200.8 Metals-Molybendum Each 15

30.00$                 450.00$                                   18.00$                 270.00$                                   No Bid -$                                         

 200.7 - $28.00

200.8 - $33.00 

 200.7 - $420.00

200.8 - $495.00 

39 SM 5310B DOC Each 15 25.00$                 375.00$                                   32.00$                 480.00$                                   No Bid -$                                         60.00$                 900.00$                                   

40 Hydrogen Sulfide Each 15 100.00$               1,500.00$                                58.00$                 870.00$                                   No Bid -$                                         30.00$                 450.00$                                   

41

Total Oragnic Nitogen AQ Plus SO4, F, Br, 

Cl
Each 15

65.00$                 975.00$                                   120.00$               1,800.00$                                No Bid -$                                         140.00$               2,100.00$                                

42 EPA 200.8 Dissolved Metals Each 15 30.00$                 450.00$                                   18.00$                 270.00$                                   No Bid -$                                         18.00$                 270.00$                                   

43 EPA 300.1 Chlorite Each 15 30.00$                 450.00$                                   No Bid -$                                         No Bid -$                                         No Bid -$                                         

44 EPA 317 Bromate Each 15 100.00$               1,500.00$                                No Bid -$                                         No Bid -$                                         No Bid -$                                         

45 EPA 900.0 Gross Alpha Each 15 60.00$                 900.00$                                   50.00$                 750.00$                                   No Bid -$                                         150.00$               2,250.00$                                

46 EPA 903.1: Ra 226 & EPA 904.0: Ra 22 Each 15 160.00$               2,400.00$                                185.00$               2,775.00$                                No Bid -$                                         240.00$               3,600.00$                                

47 EPA Method 200.7 Dissolved Metals Each 15 30.00$                 450.00$                                   18.00$                 270.00$                                   No Bid -$                                         15.00$                 225.00$                                   

48 EPA Method 524.2 TTHM Each 15 60.00$                 900.00$                                   50.00$                 750.00$                                   No Bid -$                                         85.00$                 1,275.00$                                

49 Haloacetic Acid by 552.3 Each 15 100.00$               1,500.00$                                125.00$               1,875.00$                                No Bid -$                                         160.00$               2,400.00$                                

50 SM 9223B Fecal Indicator E/coli MPN Each 15 40.00$                 600.00$                                   No Bid -$                                         No Bid -$                                         100.00$               1,500.00$                                

51 SM 2320B Alkalinity Each 15 15.00$                 225.00$                                   18.00$                 270.00$                                   No Bid -$                                         20.00$                 300.00$                                   

52 SM2540C MOD Total Dissolved Solids Each 15 15.00$                 225.00$                                   15.00$                 225.00$                                   No Bid -$                                         20.00$                 300.00$                                   

53 SM4500-H+B/9040C: pH Each 15 5.00$                   75.00$                                     10.00$                 150.00$                                   No Bid -$                                         12.00$                 180.00$                                   

54 Sulfite by EPA Method 377.1 Each 15 70.00$                 1,050.00$                                25.00$                 375.00$                                   No Bid -$                                         30.00$                 450.00$                                   

55 Total Organic Halogens Each 15 100.00$               1,500.00$                                110.00$               1,650.00$                                No Bid -$                                         150.00$               2,250.00$                                

56

Miscellaneous Charges 

Shipping/Handling/Filter
$

See Below *

Wood Environment

See Below *

Cardinal Laboratories

See Below *

TestAmerica

See Below *

*Primary Vendor

Hall Environmental

*Secondary Vendor

Bid Results

IFB 20-UT-030 Water and Wastewater Lab Testing Services

1



57
Emergency Analytical Testing Surcharge

% per 

sample
50

100%

97,725.00$                              66,760.00$                              93,600.00$                              178,175.00$                            

7,695.84$                                -$                                         -$                                         12,138.17$                              

 $                           105,420.84 66,760.00$                              93,600.00$                              190,313.17$                            

 $                              (4,886.25) -$                                         -$                                         -$                                         

 $                             92,838.75  $                             66,760.00  $                             93,600.00  $                           178,175.00 

*No Charge for shipping/handling Each Sample is subject to $2.50 Safe and Item Number 7 & 8: Test costs #8 Chronic collect samples MWF

Filter costs are $15.00 per Sample, when requested Environmentally Responsible Waste Management were provided to perform four and overnight to sub-lab

Fee. tests:  Acute Ceriodaphnia, #9,20,31,88 All include metals

Chronic Ceriodaphnia, Acute digestion fee.

*Bid Item 56: Client is responsible for cost of Pimephales, and Chronic #17 Includes TCLPVOC, 

Posted to website 7/8/20 return shipment of samples and rush bottle kit Pimephales. TCLPMetals, TCLPPCBS,

orders.  Lab does not provide filters for field Item Number 56:  If we are TCLPPest/Herb

filterning of samples for Dissolved analyses. required to cover the cost of #49 Use EPA 552.2

Lab can provide filtering, when acceptable per shipping samples to our laboratory #56 Shipping Charge varies

method, at $5.00 per sample. there will be an additional shipping based on weight.

charge of $80.00 per cooler shipment. #25 & #38 Pricing for 200.7 and

**Bid item 57: Rush Surcharges (Business Days) 200.8 metals includes digestion

fee.  

Discrepencies - totals do not match original bid submission

Exceptions

Low Bid

2nd Low Bid

5 Day - 30%

Subtotal Bid Submission

Exceptions

NM Resident Contractor Preference 5%

Total Amount with Preference Applied for 

Evaluation Purposes Oncy

Tax @ 7.875%

Total  Bid Price Including Tax

3rd Low Bid

4 Day - 45%

3 Day - 60%

2 Day - 75%

1 Day - 100%

See Below **

ExceptionsExceptions

See Below **See Below **
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